
 

323 W. Michigan Ave. 
  

Marshall, MI  49068 
  

p 269.781.5183 
  

f 269.781.3835 
  

cityofmarshall.com 

The electronic public meeting will be held as a webinar using the ZOOM 
virtual meeting platform.   
Register in advance for this webinar: 
https://us02web.zoom.us/s/86207662123?pwd=ZVBBN0Rwb0pHemdFN
3BvQmFhK0NkUT09 
 
The public may participate in the virtual meeting by using the link listed 
above or join by phone at  
1-301-715-8592 Meeting ID: 862 0766 2123  
 

 
CITY COUNCIL 

WORK SESSION AGENDA 
Monday, January 4, 2021 

6:00 PM 
 

A. 2020 Water and Wastewater Rate Review 

 Director of Public Services Marguerite Davenport, Water 
 Superintendent Aaron Ambler, and Wastewater Superintendent 
 Alec Egnatuk will present the latest water and wastewater rate 
 review findings 

 
B. Other items 

 
C. Future Work Sessions 

 
a. CityWorks & Asset Management Tuesday, January 19th  
b. 2021 Strategic Planning  April 9th & 10th  

 
D. Future topics 
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2020 Water/Sewer Rate Study
Aaron Ambler, Water Superintendent
Alec Egnatuk, Wastewater Superintendent
Marguerite Davenport, Director of Public Services

Introduction
• Providing quality drinking water and wastewater treatment is an 

essential service for our residents.
• Over many years our community has invested in the essential 

infrastructure and services necessary to provide its residents with 
safe and potable drinking water and wastewater treatment.

• The construction and maintenance of this infrastructure is one of 
the costliest investments the residents in our community will make.

• Community officials strive to ensure that the residents’ investment 
in these facilities is based on sound judgment, cost effectiveness and 
sustainable financing for the present and future.  The purpose of 
analyzing utility rates is to ensure;
▫ Compliance with federal and state regulations
▫ That adequate revenue is collected through service charges to support 

cost of servicing the residents
▫ That the rates are equitable to all users of the service
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Revenue Required = Total System Cost

O&M 

Labor

Materials

Replacement

Machine 
Components
•Grinder Teeth
•Pump Motor

Lab 
Equipment

Capital

Building 
Expansion

Clarifier 
Rehab

Admin

Billing/Meter 
Reading

Testing and 
Reports

Debt

Bonds

Ensuring that the revenue covers the total system cost means the service is

“sustainable”. That is, the system will serve the present needs and will continue to

meet future needs. Total system cost is compromised of the following components:

Water/Sewer Rate Cost Structure
• Customers are charged a readiness-to-serve charge for water and 

sewer each billing cycle

• Customers are also charged a commodity charge for the actual 

water consumed and wastewater discharged based on the water 

meter reading

Cost Structure

Meter: 
Water 
Sewer

100 
Cft

748 
gallons
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Aaron Ambler, Water Superintendent

WATER DEPARTMENT ADMINISTRATIONS EXPENSES (591-539)

Proposed 
Budget

YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5

ANNUAL INCREASE 2.0% 2.0% 2.0% 2.0%

ADMINSTRATIONS BUDGET 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

EXPENSES $      903,375  $      921,443  $      939,871  $      958,669  $      977,842 

BOND INTEREST PAID
(FROM BOND/DEBT PAGE)

$    (203,225) $    (207,290) $    (211,435) $    (215,664) $    (219,977)

SUBTRACT DB RETIREMENT 
ACCRUAL (PER J. BARTLETT)

$       (65,125) $       (66,428) $       (67,756) $       (69,111) $       (70,493)

TOTAL $      635,025  $      647,726  $      660,680  $      673,894  $      687,371 
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WATER DISTRIBUTION EXPENSES (591-544)

Proposed 
Budget

YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5

ANNUAL INCREASE 2.0% 2.0% 2.0% 2.0%

DISTRIBUTION BUDGET 591‐544 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

EXPENSES $      866,814  $      884,150  $      901,833  $      919,870  $      938,267 

DEPRECIATION $    (331,300) $    (337,926) $    (344,685) $    (351,578) $    (358,610)

TOTAL $      535,514  $      546,224  $      557,149  $      568,292  $      579,658 

WATER PRODUCTION EXPENSES (591-546)

Proposed 
Budget

YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5

ANNUAL INCREASE 2.0% 2.0% 2.0% 2.0%

PRODUCTION BUDGET 591‐546 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

EXPENSES $      204,907  $      209,005  $      213,185  $      217,449  $      221,798 

DEPRECIATION $       (12,600) $       (12,852) $       (13,109) $       (13,371) $       (13,639)

TOTAL $      192,307  $      196,153  $      200,076  $      204,078  $      208,159 
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WATER DEPARTMENT DEBT SCHEDULE

Proposed 
Budget

YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5

BOND PAYMENTS 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

NEW ‐ ISSUE 37 ‐MATURES 2040
(WATER CONTR. TO METER PROJECT)

$      177,422  $      183,172  $      188,922  $      194,672  $      199,600 

ISSUE 20 ‐ MATURES 2024 $         17,575  $         17,125  $         21,600  $         20,800 

ISSUE 21 ‐ MATURES 2023 $         11,717  $         16,417  $         16,067  $         15,533 

ISSUE 22 ‐ MATURES 2023 $           5,858  $           5,708  $         10,533  $         10,267 

ISSUE 29 ‐ MATURES 2029 $      107,240  $      103,880  $      105,450  $      101,775  $      102,950 

ISSUE 32 ‐ MATURES 2032 $         99,835  $      102,885  $      115,785  $      118,235  $      115,535 

ANTICIPATED NEW ISSUE ‐ MATURES 
2063

$         80,000  $      160,000  $      240,000  $      240,000 

TOTAL $      419,647  $      509,187  $      618,357  $      701,282  $      658,085 

POTENTIAL NEW BOND ISSUE COMING IN 2023 TO FUND THE PROPOSED NEW WATER PLANT AND MAINS 
REPLACEMENT PENDING NEED DUE TO GROWTH.

WATER DEPARTMENT CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS

YEAR
CAPITAL 

EXPENDITURES

ANNUAL 
FUNDING 
AMOUNT

RUNNING 
BALANCE

$          500,000 

2021 $          194,000  $          100,000  $          406,000 

2022 $          183,600  $          200,000  $          422,400 

2023 $                      ‐ $          250,000  $          672,400 

2024 $                      ‐ $          250,000  $          922,400 

2025 $          216,000  $          250,000  $          956,400 

2026 $          627,000  $          250,000  $          579,400 

2027 $                      ‐ $          250,000  $          829,400 

2028 $                      ‐ $          250,000  $      1,079,400 

2029 $                      ‐ $          250,000  $      1,329,400 

2030 $      1,062,000  $          250,000  $          517,400 
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WATER DEPARTMENT
CONCLUSION OF ANALYSIS

COMMODITY CHARGE

CURRENT 
COST PER 
100CFT

PROPOSED
COST PER 
100CFT

DIFFERENCE

0 ‐ 3000 CU FT $      3.07  $         3.44  $           0.37 

3001‐15000 CU FT $      2.45  $         2.75  $           0.30 

OVER 15000 CU FT $      1.84  $         2.06  $           0.22

READINESS TO SERVE

METER SIZE CURRENT PROPOSED

METER 
RATIO 
FACTOR DIFFERENCE

1" $    20.86  $      20.95  1.00 $           0.09 

1‐1/2" $    53.61  $      53.83  2.57 $           0.22 

2" $    96.71  $      97.12  4.64 $           0.41 

3" $ 217.77  $    218.69  10.44 $           0.92 

4" $ 407.62  $    409.35  19.54 $           1.73 

6" $ 876.66  $    880.39  42.02 $           3.73 

Alec Egnatuk, Wastewater Superintendent
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Mission Statement

The goal of the City of Marshall Wastewater Department is to protect 
public health and the natural resources of the State of Michigan by 

providing professional, accountable, and fiscally responsible operation of 
the Wastewater Treatment Plant and Collection System in accordance with 

applicable State of Michigan (EGLE) requirements and permits.

WASTEWATER DEPARTMENT ADMINISTRATIONS EXPENSES (590-539)

Proposed 
Budget

YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5

ANNUAL INCREASE 2.0% 2.0% 2.0% 2.0%

ADMINSTRATIONS BUDGET 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

EXPENSES $      623,674  $      636,147  $      648,870  $      661,848  $      675,085 

BOND INTEREST PAID
(FROM BOND/DEBT PAGE)

$       (64,540) $       (65,831) $       (67,147) $       (68,490) $       (69,860)

DEPRECIATION $         (1,700) $         (1,734) $         (1,769) $         (1,804) $         (1,840)

SUBTRACT DB RETIREMENT 
ACCRUAL (PER J. BARTLETT)

$       (43,500) $       (44,370) $       (45,257) $       (46,163) $       (47,086)

TOTAL $      513,934  $      524,213  $      534,697  $      545,391  $      556,299 
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WASTEWATER DEPARTMENT OPERATIONS EXPENSES (590-545)

Proposed 
Budget

YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5

ANNUAL INCREASE 2.0% 2.0% 2.0% 2.0%

OPERATIONS BUDGET 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

EXPENSES $   1,411,256  $   1,439,481  $   1,468,271  $   1,497,636  $   1,527,589 

DEPRECIATION $    (423,075) $    (431,537) $    (440,167) $    (448,971) $    (457,950)

METER READING LABOR ‐
ELIMINATED STARTING IN FY022

$       (30,000) $       (30,000) $       (30,000) $       (30,000)

ADDITIONAL STAFF GIS ‐ SPLIT 
BETWEEN 3 DEPT's (50% FY2021)

$         11,000  $         22,000  $         22,440  $         22,889  $         23,347 

TOTAL $      999,181  $      999,945  $   1,020,544  $   1,041,554  $   1,062,985 

WASTEWATER DEPARTMENT DEBT SCHEDULE

Proposed 
Budget

YEAR 2 YEAR 3 YEAR 4 YEAR 5

BOND PAYMENTS 2021 2022 2023 2024 2025

NEW ‐ ISSUE 37 ‐MATURES 2040 
(WW CONTR. TO METER PROJECT)

$         38,578  $         39,828  $         41,078  $         42,328  $         43,400 

ISSUE 31 ‐ MATURES 2031 $      214,540  $      215,040  $      210,390  $      210,740  $      210,940 

TOTAL $      253,118  $      254,868  $      251,468  $      253,068  $      254,340 

POTENTIAL NEW BOND ISSUE COMING IN 2026 TO FUND THE PROPOSED HEADWORKS UPGRADES AT THE 
WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT
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WASTEWATER DEPARTMENT CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS

YEAR
CAPITAL 

EXPENDITURES

ANNUAL 
FUNDING 
AMOUNT

RUNNING 
BALANCE

$          700,000 

2021 $          415,000  $          306,000  $          591,000 

2022 $          699,720  $          306,000  $          197,280 

2023 $          509,600  $          306,000  $             (6,320)

2024 $          408,100  $          306,000  $        (108,420)

2025 $            64,800  $          306,000  $          132,780 

2026 $            66,000  $          306,000  $          372,780 

2027 $                      ‐ $          306,000  $          678,780 

2028 $            45,600  $          306,000  $          939,180 

2029 $                      ‐ $          306,000  $      1,245,180 

2030 $                      ‐ $          306,000  $      1,551,180 

Observations

• The current Sewer REU schedule ratios do not 
match the Water REU schedule ratios. 

• We will continue with our plan to match the 
Water REU schedule by continuing to increase 
the readiness-to-serve charges equally over the 
next 3 years.
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WASTEWATER DEPARTMENT
CONCLUSION OF ANALYSIS

COMMODITY CHARGE

CURRENT  PROPOSED DIFFERENCE

PER 100 CU FT $      4.13  $         4.25  $           0.12 

READINESS TO SERVE

METER SIZE CURRENT PROPOSED

METER 
RATIO 
FACTOR DIFFERENCE

1" $    17.44  $      17.96  1.00 $           0.52 

1‐1/2" $    37.36  $      41.04  2.29 $           3.68 

2" $    56.84  $      66.81  3.72 $           9.97 

3" $ 104.37  $    134.16  7.47 $        29.79 

4" $ 210.76  $    263.47  14.67 $        52.71 

6" $ 371.58  $    506.65  28.21 $      135.07 

FLAT RATE USER FEE

CURRENT PROPOSED DIFFERENCE
BASED ON 600 
CU FT OF USAGE $    42.22  $      43.46  $           1.24 

WATER & WASTEWATER
COMBINED BILLING COMPARISONS

FAMILY OF 2 FAMILY OF 5

WATER CURRENT PROPOSED WATER CURRENT PROPOSED

USAGE OF 400 CU FT $       12.28  $       13.76  USAGE OF 6900 CU FT $       187.65  $       210.45 

1" METER CHARGE $       20.86  $       20.95  1" METER CHARGE $         20.86  $         20.95 

TOTAL $       33.14  $       34.71  TOTAL $       208.51  $       231.40 

DIFFERENCE $          1.57  DIFFERENCE $         22.89 

SEWER SEWER

400 CU FT $       16.52  $       17.00  6900 CU FT $       284.97  $       293.25 

1" METER ‐ RTS $       17.44  $       17.96  1" METER ‐ RTS $         17.44  $         17.96 

TOTAL $       33.96  $       34.96  TOTAL $       302.41  $       311.21 

DIFFERENCE $          1.00  DIFFERENCE $            8.80 

TOTAL MONTHLY 
DIFFERENCE $          2.57 

TOTAL MONTHLY 
DIFFERENCE $         31.69 

FAMILY OF 3 LARGE INDUSTRIAL USER

WATER CURRENT PROPOSED WATER CURRENT PROPOSED

USAGE OF 2000 CU FT $       61.40  $       68.80  USAGE OF 32,640 CU FT $       710.68  $       796.58 

1" METER CHARGE $       20.86  $       20.95  3" METER CHARGE $       217.77  $       218.69 

TOTAL $       82.26  $       89.75  TOTAL $       928.45  $   1,015.27 

DIFFERENCE $          7.49  DIFFERENCE $         86.82 

SEWER SEWER

2000 CU FT $       82.60  $       85.00  32,640 CU FT $   1,348.03  $   1,387.20 

1" METER ‐ RTS $       17.44  $       17.96  3" METER ‐ RTS $       104.37  $       134.16 

TOTAL $     100.04  $     102.96  TOTAL $   1,452.40  $   1,521.36 

DIFFERENCE $          2.92  DIFFERENCE $         68.96 

TOTAL MONTHLY 
DIFFERENCE $       10.41 

TOTAL MONTHLY 
DIFFERENCE $       155.78 
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The electronic public meeting will be held as a webinar using the ZOOM virtual meeting platform.   
Register in advance for this webinar: 
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/88396916319?pwd=RnRMSWFxR0VnVlJWeXpHL2RvamZiZz09 
The public may participate in the virtual meeting by using the link listed above or join by phone at  
1-301-715-8592 Meeting ID: 883 9691 6319  
 
The public will be able to listen to all discussion by Council members and will be permitted to speak 
for up to 5 minutes during the public comment section of the agenda.  Please use the ZOOM feature in 
the participant section to raise your hand or press *9 on the telephone keypad if you are using audio 
and you will be called upon to speak. 
 

 

MARSHALL CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 

Monday – 7:00 P.M.  

January 4, 2021 

 
1) OATH OF OFFICE 

2) CALL TO ORDER  

3) ROLL CALL 

4) INVOCATION – Kris Tarkiewicz, Family Bible Church 

5) PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

6) APPROVAL OF AGENDA – Items can be added or deleted from the Agenda by Council 
action.    

7) PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA ITEMS – Persons addressing Council are required to 
give their name and address for the record when called upon by the Mayor.  Members of 
the public shall be limited to speaking for a maximum of five (5) minutes on any agenda 
item. 

8) CITY COUNCIL ORGANIZATION 

A. Election of Mayor Pro-Tem 

B. Boards and Commissions Liaison Appointments 

C. Firekeeper’s Local Revenue Sharing Board Appointment 

D. Calhoun County Consolidated Dispatch Authority Board Appointment 

9) CONSENT AGENDA               

A. City Council Minutes                                                   

  Regular Session ................................................ Monday, December 7, 2020 

B. City Bills                                                             

 Regular Purchases ................................................................... $ 206,284.97 

 Regular Purchases ..................................................................... $ 81,204.21 

 Purchased Power ..................................................................... $ 714,558.88 

 Weekly Purchases –12/4/20 .................................................... $ 118,795.58 

 Weekly Purchases –12/11/20 .................................................... $ 40,701.82 

 Weekly Purchases –12/18/20 .................................................... $ 43,271.04 

 Weekly Purchases –12/23/20 .................................................... $ 59,107.32 

 Total ...................................................................................... $ 1,263,923.82 

10) PRESENTATIONS AND RECOGNITIONS  

11) INFORMATIONAL ITEMS 1/4/21 CC Packet 13



12) PUBLIC HEARINGS & SUBSEQUENT COUNCIL ACTION  

A. Amendments to City Ordinance Chapter 70: Vehicle and Traffic Code 

City Council will hear public comment regarding the proposed amendments to 
sections 70.13 through 70.17 of Chapter 70: Vehicle and Traffic of the Marshall 
City Code of Ordinances.  

13) OLD BUSINESS  

14) REPORTS AND RECOMMENDATIONS    

A. 2021 Strategic Planning Work Session Date 

 City Council will consider the recommendation to establish Strategic Planning 
 Work Session dates for April 9 and 10, 2021. 

B. Clarifier Equipment Bids          

City Council will consider the recommendation to award the Clarifier 
Rehabilitation Project Equipment Purchase to WesTech, through their local 
representative, Hamlett Environmental of Howell, MI in the amount of 
$313,171.00 and to authorize the City Clerk to sign the contract. 

15) APPOINTMENTS / ELECTIONS                  

16) PUBLIC COMMENT ON NON-AGENDA ITEMS 

Persons addressing Council are required to give their name and address for the record 
when called upon by the Mayor.  Members of the public shall be limited to speaking for a 
maximum of five (5) minutes on any item not on the agenda. 

17)  COUNCIL AND MANAGER COMMUNICATIONS  

18) ADJOURNMENT 

Respectfully submitted,  

 

Tom Tarkiewicz 
City Manager 
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CITY OF MARSHALL, MICHIGAN 
RESOLUTION #2021- 

 
RESOLUTION APPOINTING REPRESENTATIVE AND ALTERNATES 

TO THE LOCAL REVENUE SHARING BOARD 
 

 WHEREAS, the Urban Cooperation Act of 1967 (MCL 124.501 et seq., as amended: 
hereinafter the “Urban Cooperation Act”) provides that Public agencies of the State of Michigan 
and Public agencies of the United States may enter into interlocal agreements to exercise jointly 
with each other any power, privilege or authority that the agencies share in common and that 
each may exercise separately; and  
 
 WHEREAS, under subsection 2(e) of the Urban Cooperation Act (MCL 124.502(e)), 
Calhoun County, Emmett Charter Township, the City of Battle Creek, the City of Marshall, and 
Athens Township are Public agencies of the State of Michigan, each of which have the authority 
to enter into an interlocal agreement; and 
 
 WHEREAS, for purposes of the Urban Cooperation Act, the Nottawaseppi Huron Band 
of the Potawatomi Indians (hereinafter “the Tribe”) is treated as a Public agency of the United 
States with the authority to enter into an interlocal agreement; and 
 
 WHEREAS, in accordance with the Indian Gaming Regulatory Act (25 U.S.C. 2701 et 
seq,; hereinafter referred to as “IGRA”), on December 3, 1998 the State of Michigan and the 
Tribe made and entered into a Compact providing for the conduct of casino gaming, as approved 
by the U.S. Secretary of the Interior by publication in the Federal Register on February 18, 1999 
(64 Fed. Reg. 8111), and as amended on July 23, 2009 in accordance with Section 16 of the 
Compact and approved by the U.S. Secretary of the Interior by publication in the Federal 
Register on October 8, 2009, (74 Fed. Reg. 51875) (hereinafter collectively referred to as the 
“Compact”); and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Tribe, a federally-recognized Indian tribe, acting under its governmental 
authority in accordance with IGRA and the Compact, commenced casino gaming operations on 
August 1, 2009, at the Firekeepers Casino (hereinafter the “Casino”) on land located in Emmett 
Township, Michigan that is held in trust for the Nottawaseppi Huron Band by the United States; 
and 
 
 WHEREAS, growth and development on and in the vicinity of the Pine Creek Indian 
Reservation, which is the governmental and community center of the Tribe, will have impacts on 
Athens Township, which will be affected by the Tribe’s operation of the Casino; and  
 
 WHEREAS, the Compact provides that the local units of government that are in the 
immediate vicinity or are otherwise directly affected by the Casino, together with the local 
government(s) affected by growth and development of the Tribe’s governmental and community 
facilities on and in the immediate vicinity of the Pine Creek Reservation that will result from the 
operation of the Casino, may, at their option, form a Local Revenue Sharing Board in 
conjunction with the Tribe for the purpose of receiving and directing the disbursement of 
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revenue sharing payments required by the Compact; and 
 
 WHEREAS, by entering into this interlocal agreement (hereinafter this “Agreement”), 
the parties hereto seek to create a Local Revenue Sharing Board, consistent with the terms and 
provisions of the Compact and for the purposes stated therein; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Local revenue Sharing Board bylaws allow appointment of a Board 
representative and Board alternates. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED that the City of Marshall appoints  
____________ as the Board representative and _________ as the Board alternate. 
 
Motion by:  
 
AYES, Council members:  
 
NAYES, Council members:  
 
ABSTAIN, Council members:  
 
RESOLUTION DECLARED ADOPTED.  
 
CERTIFICATE  
 
The foregoing is a true and a complete copy of the resolution adopted by the City Council and 
the City of Marshall at a regular meeting on January 4, 2021. Public notice was given and the 
meeting was conducted in full compliance with the Michigan Open Meetings Act (PA 267, 1976, 
as amended). Minutes of the meeting will be available as required by the Act.  
 
       City of Marshall 
 
 
 
       ________________________ 
       By:   Trisha Nelson 
       Its:   Clerk 
        
 

Date:   
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Stantec Consulting Michigan Inc. 
3754 Ranchero Drive, Ann Arbor MI  48108-2771 

 

   

 
 

December 28, 2020 
File: 2075107908 

Attention:  Ms. Marguerite Davenport, PE, Director of Public Services 
 Mr. Alec Egnatuk, Wastewater Superintendent 
City of Marshall 
323 W. Michigan Avenue 
Marshall, Michigan 49068 

Dear Ms. Davenport and Mr. Egnatuk, 

Reference: Bid Review – WWTP Clarifiers Procurement – Marshall WWTP 

Bids for the above-referenced project were received at Marshall City Hall on Friday, December 18, 2020, 

where they were opened at 10:00 AM.  Four bids were received from specialty manufacturers, known to be 

engaged in the production of wastewater process equipment.  A bid tab summarizing the bid prices for the 

clarifier mechanism procurement options and overall project phases is attached for your review. 

Primary and secondary clarification are two of the most essential unit processes in wastewater treatment.  

To consistently produce high quality effluent over a very long service life, clarifier equipment manufacturers 

must have experience, a reputation for producing quality products, engineering expertise, and are known 

for standing behind their products.  Stantec developed a screening process to identify manufacturers who 

meet these criteria and who were then encouraged to bid on this project.  A memo describing this screening 

process is attached for your reference. 

A major portion of the clarification equipment is submerged in wastewater and therefore, is subject to 

corrosion.  Using stainless steel rather than painted steel can provide protection against the premature 

deterioration of critical components.  Since the cost for stainless steel is generally much higher, the bid 

proposal was designed to ascertain the difference in cost between painted steel and stainless steel to allow 

a more informed decision for this project.  It should be noted that the contract specifications require a very 

robust quality control protocol for surface preparation and painting of steel and full documentation of quality 

assurance of all manufacturing processes.  Based on our analysis of the bids received, we recommend 

selecting the painted steel alternate. 

Due to differences in the process design approach and equipment components, such as the clarifier drives, 

Stantec contacted the bidders to obtain their clarifications on the submitted bids.  The bid tab reflects these 

clarifications.  Based on our bid analysis, Stantec recommends that the City select either one of the two low 

bidders, namely WesTech Engineering, Inc. or Ovivo USA, LLC. 

It should be noted that this contract is for the procurement of equipment to be shipped in 2021 only.  The 

City may choose to lock in a price for the planned year 2023 shipment.  Stantec is in process of preparing 

bidding documents for installation of the clarifier equipment in the summer of 2021. 
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December 28, 2020 

Ms. Marguerite Davenport, PE, Director of Public Services 

Mr. Alec Egnatuk, Wastewater Superintendent 

Page 2 of 2  

Reference: Bid Review – WWTP Clarifiers Procurement – Marshall WWTP 

  

 

Should the City choose to award the overall project to either WesTech Engineering or Ovivo USA, we would 

be pleased to prepare a procurement contract for signatures.  If you have any questions concerning our bid 

review, please do not hesitate to contact us.    

Regards, 

Stantec Consulting Michigan Inc. 

Ken Jewison  PE 
Project Manager 
Phone: 734 892 9041  
Fax: 734 761 1200  
Ken.Jewison@stantec.com  

Ish Naik  PE 
Principal 
Phone: 734 368 3112  
Fax: 734 761 1200  
Ish.Naik@stantec.com 

Attachment: Bid Tabulation 

ed v:\2075\active\2075107908\civil\design\correspondence\let_marshall_wwtp_clarifiers_bid_review_20201228.docx 
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Bid Date:  December 18, 2020

10:00 AM, local time

 

Created 12/18/2020

Updated 12/28/2020

 

Bidder 
Primary 

Clarifier

Secondary 

Clarifier

2021 Total     

(Painted 

Steel)

Primary 

Clarifier SS 

Option

Secondary 

Clarifier SS 

Option

2021 Total     

(Stainless Steel)

2023 Price 

Escalation

2023 Total  

(Painted 

Steel)

2023 Total 

(Stainless Steel)

WesTech Engineering, Inc. 134,808$        178,363$        313,171$        145,645$        193,588$        339,233$            5% 328,830$        356,195$            

Ovivo USA 144,974$        148,993$        293,967$        166,926$        170,945$        337,870$            3% 302,786$        348,006$            

Envirodyne Systems Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid 168,200$        160,200$        328,400$            5% No Bid 344,820$            

Evoqua Water Technologies 196,962$        292,878$        489,840$        241,565$        304,341$        545,906$            20% 587,808$        655,087$            Secondary Clarifier price reflects suction header.

Bid Tabulation

for
WWTP Clarifier Rehabilitation, Furnishing Clarifiers, Contract 1

for

City of Marshall, Michigan

2075107908

Remarks

Sludge Ring Base Bid. Potential reduction in cost by reusing the existing drives

Rotating Sludge Drum Base Bid.

Only offering Stainless Steel.  Price reflects suction header, their least expensive offering.

Bid Date : December 18, 2020

1

WWTP Clarifiers Rehabilitation, Furnihsing Clarifiers, Contract 1

2075107908
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